
IFB #26-002

Thursday, January 15, 2026POSTED: 
OPENED: Wednesday, February 11, 2026 at 11:00 AM
TENTATIVE AWARD DATE:  Wednesday, April 1, 2026 
CONTRACT PERIOD:  April 1, 2026 - March 31, 2027

RECOMMENDED  AWARD

LINE DESCRIPTION
 IFB  2026-

2027 UNIT of 
ITEM QUANTITIES MEASURE Unit Ext Vendor

8B

Chlorine/Sodium Hypochlorite, 
liquid, 15%   concentration, 
packaged 15 gal drum 1,635 GAL 7.2500$    11,853.75$    Brenntag

14
Ferric Chloride, liquid, 40% 
concentration, Bulk 12,000 GAL 3.0000$    36,000.00$    Brenntag

19

Hydrofluosilicic Acid, liquid,  23.8% 
concentration, bulk tank trucks,  20 
tons per tank 200,000 LBS 0.4900$    98,000.00$    Brenntag

20
Hydrofluosilicic Acid, liquid, 23.8% 
conc, 150 lb drums 16,560 LBS 0.7700$    12,751.20$    Brenntag

28A
Soda, caustic, 50%, liquid 55 gallon 
drums 1,010 GAL 4.4500$    4,494.50$    Brenntag

30 Sodium Bisulfite, 38%, bulk 44,000 GAL 3.85$    169,400.00$    Brenntag
32 Sulfuric Acid, 93%, bulk 75,000 GAL 3.18$     238,500.00$    Brenntag
38 Hydrogen Peroxide 50% 0 GAL 2.8000$   2.80$     Brenntag

571,002.25$     Brenntag

7

Chlorine/Sodium Hypochlorite, 
liquid,  15%concentration, bulk, <= 
4,000 gal/delivery 88,629 GAL 3.8700$    342,994.23$    Buckman's

342,994.23$     Buckman's
25 Quick Lime, pulverized, bulk 1,925,000 LBS 0.255795$   492,405.38$    Carmeuse

492,405.38$     Carmeuse

8C

Chlorine/Sodium Hypochlorite, 
liquid, 15%   concentration, 
packaged 5 gal Carboy 0 GAL 7.2670$    1,090.05$    Coyne

9 Citric Acid, 50%, 275 gal totes 20,900 GAL 6.5631$    137,168.79$    Coyne
138,258.84$     Coyne

4 Bioxide 246,000 GAL 3.44$    846,240.00$    Evoqua

18
Ferrous Sulfate, liquid, bulk, tank 
truck 175,000 GAL 1.5800$    276,500.00$    Evoqua

34 EVOQUA VX 456 mixed Oxidant 4,000 GAL 15.2100$    60,840.00$    Evoqua
37 Bioxide, Plus 71 0 GAL 4.0500$   4.05$     Evoqua

1,183,584.05$   Evoqua

5A
Chlorine (liquefied gas) 1 ton 
cylinders 168,000 LBS 0.8875$    149,100.00$    Jones

149,100.00$     Jones

13
Diatomecious Earth (solid), #545, 50 
lb bags 250 LBS -$   NO BID

CHEMICAL- WATER, POOL, & SEWAGE TREATMENT 
 ***OFFICIAL Bid Results***

The County of Lancaster considers no bids to be “official” until a Resolution is 
Bidders should therefore consider the bids posted below as “unofficial” and not 

2026-2027 PRICES 
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16

Ferrous Chloride, liquid, 10% 
concentration,  bulk, >/= 4,000 
gal/delivery 32,000 GAL -$    NO BID

21 Liquid Oxygen, bulk, tank truck 0 GAL -$    NO BID
22 Muriatic Acid (15 gallon carboys) 220 CARBOY -$    NO BID

36A Granular Chlorine  HTH 300 LBS -$    NO BID

36B
Chlorine, Autofeed Pool Grade 
Tablet (HTH) 0 LBS -$    NO BID

40 Vita-D Chlor Slo- Tabs, 35lb Bucket 1,400 LBS -$    NO BID

23 Orange Aid, degreaser, 5 gal pails 1,201 GAL  $    38.2000 45,878.20$    NORWECO

39 Vita-D Chlor Tablets, 35lb Bucket 1,093 LBS 15.2920$   16,714.16$    NORWECO
62,592.36$     NORWECO

10 Cyclone, liquid solvent, 5 gal pails 500 GAL 3.6000$    1,800.00$    Paradigm

11
Defoamer, silicone base, 55 gal 
drums 1,400 GAL 8.0000$    11,200.00$    Paradigm

13,000.00$     Paradigm
26 Sea Quest, 50 lb pail 2,000 LBS 3.4400$     6,880.00$    Shannon

6,880.00$     Shannon

2
Aluminum Sulfate/Alum (liquid), 55 
gal drum 1,485 GAL 3.6400$    5,405.40$    Univar

3
Aluminum Sulfate\Alum, powder 
(lbs) 50lb bags, delivery >/= 4,000 lb 35,500 LBS 0.4870$    17,288.50$    Univar

5B
Chlorine (liquefied gas) 150 lb 
cylinders 10,236 LBS 2.2220$    22,744.39$    Univar

6

Chlorine/Sodium Hypochlorite, 
liquid,15% concentration, bulk, >= 
4,000 gal/delivery 371,000 GAL 1.5779$    585,400.90$    Univar

8A

Chlorine/Sodium Hypochlorite, 
liquid, 15%   concentration, 
packaged 55 gal drum 4,895 GAL 3.2100$    15,712.95$    Univar

15
Ferric Chloride, liquid, 40% 
concentration, 600 lb poly drum 1 GAL 4.7900$    4.79$     Univar
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24

Potassium Permanganate, crystal 
solid free flowing crystal solid, 55 lb 
polyethlene container 55 LBS 4.4500$    244.75$    Univar

27 Soda, caustic, 25%, liquid, bulk 151,600 GAL 1.0030$    152,054.80$    Univar

28B
Soda, caustic, 50%, liquid 15 gallon 
containers 19 CWT 47.0000$    893.00$    Univar

29
Soda ash, solid, powder, light, 99% 
concentrate, 50 lb bags 57,300 LBS 0.4600$    26,358.00$    Univar

31
Sodium Bisulfite, 38%, packaged, 
320 gal tote 5,300 GAL 3.5300$    18,709.00$    Univar

33 Sulfur Dioxide; 150  lb cylinder 4,300 LBS 1.5600$    6,708.00$    Univar

35 Calcium Hypochlorite, solid granular 500 LBS 3.1000$   1,550.00$    Univar
853,074.48$     Univar

1 Aluminum Sulfate/Alum (liquid), bulk 187,000 GAL 1.5462$    289,139.40$    USALCO
12A Poly Aluminum Chloride (Water) 215,000 GAL 3.5874$    771,291.00$    USALCO

12B
Poly Aluminum Chloride (Waste 
Water) 166,000 GAL 3.0251$    502,166.60$    USALCO

17
Ferrous Chloride, liquid, industrial 
grade, bulk, >/= 4,000 gal/delivery 25,000 GAL 1.5660$    39,150.00$    USALCO

1,601,747.00$   USALCO


