Road Pipes, Boxes, Grates and Frames IFB (25-024)
OFFICIAL BID TABULATION

POSTED: Thursday, October 2, 2025

OPENED: Thursday, October 30, 2025 - 11:00 AM
AWARD DATE: Wednesday, January 21, 2026
CONTRACT PERIOD: February 1, 2026 - January 31, 2027

The County of Lancaster considers no bids to be “official” until a Resolution

is approved by the Board of Commissioners.
Bidders should therefore consider the bids posted below as “unofficial” and
not to make any assumptions nor take any actions based on these results.

AWARDED VENDOR

Chemung Supply Corp Mid Atlantic Precast
BASE PERIOD BASE PERIOD
2026-2027
01/01/2026 - 12/31/2027 01/01/2026 - 12/31/2027
1. Corrugated Polyethelyne Pipes and Connectors) AWARDED VENDOR
1-A: Corrugated polyethelyne pipe, round, corrugated Est. o L Total L L Total
exterior/siooth‘:ntirior, ‘t,ypeps?integral bell & 5pigot union, Quantity Unit Price Unit Price DELIVERED Unit Price | Unit Price DELIVERED Unit Price Total Price Vendor
. DELIVERED PICK-UP . DELIVERED]| PICK-UP .
20' standard length (linear ft) Price Price
4" dia 118 227 |S 227 | S 2.27 | no bid no bid no bid S 227 |$ 2.27 Chemung
6" dia 300 | $ 438|$ 438 1,314.00 | no bid no bid no bid S 438 1,314.00 | Chemung
15" dia 2,520 | $ 11.14 | S 11.14 | $  28,072.80 | no bid no bid no bid S 11.14 | S 28,072.80 Chemung
18" dia 2,080 | S 15.13 | $ 15.13 [ $  31,470.40 | no bid no bid no bid S 15.13 | $ 31,470.40 Chemung
24" dia 1,240 | S 2449 | $ 2449 | S 30,367.60 | no bid no bid no bid S 2449 | $ 30,367.60 Chemung
30" dia 780 | $ 36.48 | S 36.48 | S 28,454.40 | no bid no bid no bid S 36.48 | S 28,454.40 Chemung
36" dia 300 (S 47.24 S 47.24 S 14,172.00 | no bid no bid no bid S 47.24 S 14,172.00 Chemung
42" dia 1]$ 64.97 | S 64.97 | S 64.97 | no bid no bid no bid S 64.97 | S 64.97 | Chemung
48" dia 100 | $ 76.54 | $§ 76.54 | $ 7,654.00 | no bid no bid no bid S 76.54 | 7,654.00 Chemung
60" dia 140 | $ 162.98 | $ 162.98 | $  22,817.20 | no bid no bid no bid S 162.98 | $ 22,817.20 Chemung
1-B: Corrugated polyethlene pipe, round corrugated ESt'_ Unit Price Unit Price Total Unit Price | Unit Price Total L )
exterior/srgnoothpintyerior stp: s‘j plain end, 20'gstandard length. | 22" | bevverep | pickeup DELIVERED |\\c werep| pick-up | PELVERED | UnitPrice | Total Price Vendor
(linear ft) Price Price
4" dia 1 S 227 |S 227 |$ 2.27 | no bid no bid no bid S 227 |$ 2.27 Chemung
6" dia 1 S 438|S 438|S 4.38 | no bid no bid no bid S 438|S 4.38 | Chemung
15" dia 200 S 11.14 | S 11.14 | S 2,228.00 | no bid no bid no bid S 1114 | S 2,228.00 Chemung
18" dia 1 S 1513 | $ 1513 | $ 15.13 | no bid no bid no bid S 1513 | $ 15.13 | Chemung
24" dia 20 S 2449 | $ 2449 | $ 489.80 | no bid no bid no bid S 2449 | $ 489.80 Chemung
30" dia 1 S 36.48 | S 36.48 | S 36.48 | no bid no bid no bid S 36.48 | S 36.48 | Chemung
36" dia 1 S 47.24 S 47.24 S 47.24 | no bid no bid no bid S 47.24 S 47.24 Chemung
42" dia 1 S 64.97 | S 64.97 | S 64.97 | no bid no bid no bid S 64.97 | S 64.97 | Chemung
48" dia 1 S 76.54 | $§ 76.54 | $ 76.54 | no bid no bid no bid S 76.54 | $ 76.54 Chemung
60" dia 1 S 162.98 | $ 162.98 | $ 162.98 | no bid no bid no bid S 162.98 | $ 162.98 [ Chemung
1-C: Corrugated polyethelyne pipe, round, perforated, type SP, Est. o o Total L L Total
corrugatej exter‘i)or;smoo\ll:h inpt:rior, integfal bell & spiz:t Quantity Unit Price Unit Price DELIVERED Unit Price | Unit Price DELIVERED Unit Price Total Price Vendor
. h DELIVERED PICK-UP . DELIVERED]| PICK-UP .
union, 2-' standard length (linear ft) Price Price
15" dia 1 S 11.14 | S 11.14 | S 11.14 | no bid no bid no bid I S 11.14 | S 11.14 Chemung




18" dia 1 S 15.13 | $ 15.13 | $ 15.13 | no bid no bid no bid S 15.13 | $ 15.13 Chemung
24" dia 1 S 2449 | S 2449 | S 24.49 | no bid no bid no bid S 2449 | S 24.49 | Chemung
30" dia 1 S 36.48 | $ 36.48 | $ 36.48 | no bid no bid no bid S 36.48 | $ 36.48 Chemung
36" dia 1 S 47.24 | $ 47.24 | $ 47.24 | no bid no bid no bid S 47.24 | $ 47.24 | Chemung
1-D: Corrugated polyethelyne pipe, round, corrugated exterior ESt'_ Unit Price Unit Price Total Unit Price | Unit Price Total L )
and interiogr, typ: C,yplain an,pz‘t))' standard Iengfh Quantity | e \verep | pick-up DELIVERED | \\c\ werep| pick-up | PELVERED | UnitPrice | Total Price Vendor
(linear ft) Price Price
15" dia 1 S 11.14 | S 11.14 | S 11.14 | no bid no bid no bid S 11.14 | S 11.14 Chemung
18" dia 1 S 1513 | $ 1513 | $ 15.13 | no bid no bid no bid S 1513 | $ 15.13 | Chemung
24" dia 1 S 2449 | $ 2449 | $ 24.49 | no bid no bid no bid S 2449 | $ 24.49 Chemung
30" dia 1 S 36.48 | S 36.48 | S 36.48 | no bid no bid no bid S 36.48 | S 36.48 | Chemung
36" dia 1 S 4487 S 44.87 [ S 44.87 | no bid no bid no bid S 44.87 [ S 44.87 Chemung
. ) Est. . R Total R R Total
1-E: Couplings/connectors for corrugated polyethelne pipe, 5 Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price | Unit Price L |
round (EACH) C%uantlty DELIVERED PICK-UP DELI\{ERED peLveren| pick-up DELI\{ERED Unit Price Total Price Vendor
(linear ft) Price Price
4" dia 1 S 193 |$ 193 [$ 1.93 | no bid no bid no bid S 193 S 1.93 | Chemung
6" dia 1 S 4511|S 451 (S 4.51 | no bid no bid no bid S 451 (S 4.51 Chemung
15" dia 10 S 15.95 | $ 15.95 | $ 159.50 | no bid no bid no bid S 15.95 | $ 159.50 [ Chemung
18" dia 7 S 2719 | S 27.19 | $ 190.33 | no bid no bid no bid S 27.19 | $ 190.33 Chemung
24" dia 4 S 3834 (S 3834 (S 153.36 | no bid no bid no bid S 3834 (S 153.36 | Chemung
30" dia 2 S 89.13 | $ 89.13 | $ 178.26 | no bid no bid no bid S 89.13 | $ 178.26 Chemung
36" dia 1 S 124.00 | $ 124.00 | $ 124.00 | no bid no bid no bid $ 124.00 | $ 124.00 [ Chemung
42" dia 1 S 18151 | $ 181.51 | $ 181.51 | no bid no bid no bid S 181.51 | $ 181.51 Chemung
48" dia 1 S 213.07 | $ 213.07 | $ 213.07 | no bid no bid no bid $ 213.07 | $ 213.07 | Chemung
60" dia 1 S 33145 (S 33145 (S 331.45 | no bid no bid no bid S 33145 (S 331.45 Chemung
Est. Unit Price Unit Price Total Unit Price | Unit Price Total
1-F: Elbow, 45 degrees (EACH) Quantity DELIVERED DELIVERED Unit Price Total Price Vendor
(linear ft) DELIVERED PICK-UP Price DELIVERED| PICK-UP Price
4" dia 1 S 12.03 | $ 12.03 | $ 12.03 | no bid no bid no bid S 12.03 | $ 12.03 | Chemung
6" dia 1 S 19.84 | $ 19.84 | S 19.84 | no bid no bid no bid S 19.84 | S 19.84 Chemung
15" dia 1 S 103.27 | $ 103.27 | $ 103.27 | no bid no bid no bid $ 103.27 | $ 103.27 | Chemung
18" dia 1 S 13759 | $ 13759 | $ 137.59 | no bid no bid no bid S 13759 | $ 137.59 Chemung
24" dia 1 S 281.00 | $ 281.00 | $ 281.00 | no bid no bid no bid $ 281.00 | $ 281.00 | Chemung
30" dia 1 S 437.61 | $ 43761 | S 437.61 | no bid no bid no bid S 43761 | S 437.61 Chemung
36" dia 1 S 670.28 | $ 670.28 | $ 670.28 | no bid no bid no bid $ 670.28 | $ 670.28 | Chemung
42" dia 1 S 953.83 [ S 953.83 [ $ 953.83 | no bid no bid no bid S 953.83 [ $ 953.83 Chemung
48" dia 1 $  1,222.00 [ $ 1,222.00 | $ 1,222.00 | no bid no bid no bid S 1,222.00 [ $ 1,222.00 Chemung
60" dia 1 S 185454 |S 1,854.54 | S 1,854.54 | no bid no bid no bid S 1,854.54 | $ 1,854.54 Chemung
Est. Unit Price Unit Price Total Unit Price | Unit Price Total
1-G: Elbow, 90 degrees (EACH) Quantity DELIVERED DELIVERED Unit Price Total Price Vendor
) DELIVERED PICK-UP . DELIVERED| PICK-UP R
(linear ft) Price Price
4" dia 1 S 12.03 | $ 12.03 | $ 12.03 | no bid no bid no bid S 12.03 | $ 12.03 | Chemung
6" dia 1 S 19.84 | $ 19.84 | S 19.84 | no bid no bid no bid S 19.84 | S 19.84 Chemung
15" dia 1 S 119.18 | $ 119.18 | $ 119.18 | no bid no bid no bid $ 119.18 | $ 119.18 [ Chemung
18" dia 1 S 167.19 | $§ 167.19 | $ 167.19 | no bid no bid no bid S 167.19 | $ 167.19 Chemung
24" dia 1 S 330.60 | $ 330.60 | $ 330.60 | no bid no bid no bid $ 330.60 | $ 330.60 | Chemung
30" dia 1 S 684.22 | S 684.22 | $ 684.22 | no bid no bid no bid S 684.22 [ $ 684.22 Chemung
36" dia 1 S 911.65 | $ 911.65 | $ 911.65 | no bid no bid no bid $ 911.65 | $ 911.65 | Chemung
42" dia 1 S 133454 |S 1,33454|S 1,334.54 | no bid no bid no bid S 1,33454 | S 1,334.54 Chemung




48" dia 1 $ 160714 |$ 1,607.14 | $ 1,607.14 | no bid no bid no bid S 1,607.14 | S 1,607.14 Chemung
60" dia 1 S 2,793.64|S 279364 | S 2,793.64 | no bid no bid no bid S 2,793.64 | S 2,793.64 Chemung
Est. Unit Price Unit Price Total Unit Price | Unit Price Total
1 - H: Flared End Sections (EACH) Quantity DELIVERED DELIVERED Unit Price Total Price Vendor
(linear ft) DELIVERED PICK-UP Price DELIVERED| PICK-UP Price
4" dia 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid NO BID
6" dia 1 S 151.06 | $ 151.06 | $ 151.06 | no bid no bid no bid S 151.06 | $ 151.06 Chemung
15" dia 7 $ 15106 |$ 15106 |$  1,057.42 | nobid nobid | no bid $ 15106 |$  1,057.42 | Chemung
18" dia 6 S 202.92 [ $ 202.92 [ $ 1,217.52 | no bid no bid no bid S 202.92 [ $ 1,217.52 Chemung
24" dia 2 S 260.43 | $ 260.43 | $ 520.86 | no bid no bid no bid $ 260.43 | $ 520.86 | Chemung
30" dia 2 S 600.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,200.00 | no bid no bid no bid S 600.00 | $ 1,200.00 Chemung
36" dia 2 S 80000|$ 800.00|$  1,600.00 | no bid nobid | no bid $  800.00|$  1,600.00 | Chemung
42" dia 1 $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | no bid no bid no bid S 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 Chemung
48" dia 1 $ 1,700.00 [ $ 1,700.00 | $ 1,700.00 | no bid no bid no bid S 1,700.00 | $ 1,700.00 Chemung
60" dia 1 $ 2,900.00 |$ 2,900.00 | $ 2,900.00 | no bid no bid no bid S 2,900.00 | $ 2,900.00 Chemung
Est. . R Total R . Total
2. Inlet Boxes, Grates, and Frames Quantity Unit Price Unit Price DELIVERED Unit Price | Unit Price DELIVERED Unit Price Total Price Vendor
(linear ft) DELIVERED PICK-UP Price DELIVERED| PICK-UP Price
2-A: Inlet Box, 24" x 45 1/4", precast concrete standard, 10 | nobid no bid no bid $ 799.00 | $ 727.00 | $  7,990.00 [$  799.00|$  7,990.00 | Mid Atlantic
3"0" max height
2 - B: Height add-ons for inlet box, 6" increments 1 no bid no bid no bid S 307.00 | $ 235.00 | $ 307.00 | $ 307.00 [ $ 307.00 | Mid Atlantic
2 - C Top, precast concrete, without grate, type M 23 no bid no bid no bid S 287.00 | $ 143.00 | $ 6,601.00 | $ 287.00 [ $ 6,601.00 | Mid Atlantic
2 - D: Top, precast concrete, without grate, type M (PADOT 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CERTIFIED)
2 - E: Top, precast concrete, without grate, type S 1 no bid no bid no bid $ 574.00 | $ 286.00 | $ 574.00 | $ 574.00 | $ 574.00 | Mid Atlantic
2 - F: Top, precast concrete, without grate, type C 18 no bid no bid no bid S 287.00 | $ 143.00 | $ 5,166.00 | $ 287.00 | $ 5,166.00 | Mid Atlantic
2- G: Top, precast concrete, without grate, type C (PADOT 4 | nobid no bid no bid nobid | nobid | no bid NO BID NO BID NO BID
CERTIFIED)
2 - H: M-ALT Frame, structural steel for inlet box, 3" 11 no bid no bid no bid S 499.00 | $ 356.00 (S 5,489.00 ]S 499.00 | $ 5,489.00 | Mid Atlantic
EEF'(T:\QQDL)T Frame, structural steel for inlet box, 3" (PADOT 1 no bid no bid no bid $ 517.00 | $ 374.00 | $ 517.00|$  517.00 | $ 517.00 | Mid Atlantic
2 -J: C-ALT Frame, structural steel for inlet box, 8" 1 no bid no bid no bid S 823.00 (S 679.00 | $ 823.00]$ 823.00 | $ 823.00 | Mid Atlantic
EE:TI:I:I;F Frame, structural steel for inlet box, 8" (PADOT 1 no bid no bid no bid $ 85700 ¢ 713.00 ¢  857.00|$  857.00(% 857.00 | Mid Atlantic
2 - L: Grate, structural steel 7 no bid no bid no bid S 621.00 [ $ 477.00 (S  4,347.00] S 621.00 [ $ 4,347.00 | Mid Atlantic
2 - M: Grate, structural steel (PADOT CERTIFIED) 1 no bid no bid no bid S 645.00 | $ 501.00 | $ 645.00 | $ 645.00 | $ 645.00 [ Mid Atlantic
2 - N: Grate, structural steel, bicycle safe 26 no bid no bid no bid S 621.00 | $ 477.00 [ $ 16,146.00 ] S 621.00 [ S  16,146.00 | Mid Atlantic
2 - O: Grate, structural steel, bicycle safe (PADOT CERTIFIED) 11 no bid no bid no bid S 645.00 | $ 501.00 [ $  7,095.00 | $ 645.00 | $ 7,095.00 | Mid Atlantic
TOTAL COST $ 194,740.82 $ 56,557.00 $ 251,297.82




