3/27/2025

IFB #25-006

POSTED:
OPENED:

CHEMICAL- WATER, POOL, & SEWAGE TREATMENT

***OFFICIAL Bid Results***
Thursday, January 30, 2025
Wednesday, February 19, 2025 at 11:00 AM

TENTATIVE AWARD DATE: Wednesday, March 26, 2025
CONTRACT PERIOD: April 1, 2025 - March 31, 2026
The County of Lancaster considers no bids to be “official” until a Resolution is approved by

the Board of Com

missioners.

Bidders should therefore consider the bids posted below as “unofficial” and not to make any
assumptions nor take any actions based on these results.

OFFICIAL AWARD
IFB
LINE DESCRIPTION 2025-2026 UNIT of 2025-2026 Prices
ITEM QUANTITIES | MEASURE Unit Ext Vendor
Soda ash, solid, powder, light, 99% concentrate,

29 50 Ib bags 50,050 LBS $ 04950 [ $ 24,774.75 | Brenntag
32 Sulfuric Acid, 93%, bulk 75,000 GAL $ 2.6500 [ $ 198,750.00 [ Brenntag
38 Hydrogen Peroxide 50% 44,000 GAL $ 2.6600 | $ 117,040.00 | Brenntag

$ 340,564.75 | Brenntag
Chlorine/Sodium Hypochlorite, liquid,

7 15%concentration, bulk, <= 4,000 gal/delivery 65,305 GAL $ 3.7900 | $ 247,505.95 | Buckman's

$ 247,505.95 | Buckman's

25 Quick Lime, pulverized, bulk 1,725,000 LBS $ 0.2257 | $ 389,410.13 | Carmeuse

$ 389,410.13 | Carmeuse
8-C 5 gal Carboy 1 GAL $ 72670 (S 1,090.05 Coyne

30 Sodium Bisulfite, 38%, bulk 44,000 GAL $ 53716 | $  236,350.40 Coyne

$ 237,440.45 Coyne

4 Bioxide 140,000 GAL S 3.42 | $ 478,800.00 Evoqua
18 Ferrous Sulfate, liquid, bulk, tank truck 238,000 GAL $ 2.0300 [ $ 483,140.00 Evoqua
34 EVOQUA VX 456 mixed Oxidant 4,000 GAL $ 15.8000 | $ 63,200.00 Evoqua
37 Bioxide, Plus 71 22,000 GAL $ 4.1300 [ $ 90,860.00 Evoqua

$ 1,116,000.00 Evoqua
5-A 1 ton cylinders 132,000 LBS $ 0.9895 [ $ 130,614.00 Jones
$ 130,614.00 Jones

13 Diatomecious Earth (solid), #545, 50 Ib bags 250 LBS S - NO BID
14 Ferric Chloride, liquid, 40% concentration, Bulk 12,000 GAL $ - NO BID

Ferrous Chloride, liquid, 10% concentration,

16 bulk, >/= 4,000 gal/delivery 13,200 GAL $ - NO BID
21 Liquid Oxygen, bulk, tank truck 1 GAL $ - NO BID
22 Muriatic Acid (15 gallon carboys) 10,225 CARBOY S - NO BID
36-A Granular Chlorine HTH 500 LBS $ - NO BID
36-B Chlorine, Autofeed Pool Grade Tablet (HTH) 1 LBS $ - NO BID
40 Vita-D Chlor Slo- Tabs, 35Ib Bucket 1,400 LBS $ - NO BID
23 Orange Aid, degreaser, 5 gal pails 1,200 GAL $ 38.2000 | $  45,840.00 | NORWECO
39 Vita-D Chlor Tablets, 35lb Bucket 1,315 LBS $ 15.2920 | $  20,108.98 | NORWECO

$  65948.98 | NORWECO

10 Cyclone, liquid solvent, 5 gal pails 500 GAL $ 18.0000 | $ 9,000.00 | Paradigm
11 Defoamer, silicone base, 55 gal drums 1,400 GAL $ 8.0000 [ S 11,200.00 | Paradigm

$  20,200.00 [ Paradigm
24 flowing crystal solid, 55 Ib polyethlene container 55 LBS S 4.1600 | $ 228.80 Rhule
$ 228.80 [ Rhule

9 Citric Acid, 50%, 275 gal totes 20,900 GAL $ 81700 [ $ 170,753.00 | Shannon
26 Sea Quest, 50 Ib pail 1,900 LBS $ 3.1700 | $ 6,023.00 | Shannon

$ 176,776.00 [ Shannon

2 Aluminum Sulfate/Alum (liquid), 55 gal drum 4,110 GAL $ 3.4800 S  14,302.80 Univar

Aluminum Sulfate\Alum, powder (Ibs) 50Ib

3 bags, delivery >/= 4,000 Ib 12,000 LBS $ 04770 | S 5,724.00 Univar

5-B 150 Ib cylinders 10,536 LBS $ 22850 | S 24,074.76 Univar
Chlorine/Sodium Hypochlorite, liquid,15%

6 concentration, bulk, >= 4,000 gal/delivery 368,000 GAL $ 1.7449 | S 642,123.20 Univar
8-A 55 gal drum 4,520 GAL $ 3.4300($ 15,503.60 Univar
8-B 15 gal drum 1,485 GAL $ 5.7300 | $ 8,509.05 Univar

Ferric Chloride, liquid, 40% concentration, 600
15 Ib poly drum 1,375 GAL $ 46900 | $ 6,448.75 Univar
Hydrofluosilicic Acid, liquid, 23.8%
concentration, bulk tank trucks, 20 tons per
19 tank 200,000 LBS $ 0.2600 | $ 52,000.00 Univar
Hydrofluosilicic Acid, liquid, 23.8% conc, 150 Ib
20 drums 16,560 LBS $ 0.6800 | $ 11,260.80 Univar
27 Soda, caustic, 25%, liquid, bulk 151,600 GAL $ 1.1651 | $ 176,629.16 Univar
28-A 55 gallon drums 350 GAL $ 47100 | $ 1,648.50 Univar
28-B 15 gallon containers 19 CWT $ 54.0000 | $ 1,026.00 Univar
31 Sodium Bisulfite, 38%, packaged, 320 gal tote 5,300 GAL S 4.0200 | $ 21,306.00 Univar
33 Sulfur Dioxide; 150 Ib cylinder 700 LBS $ 29800 | $ 2,086.00 Univar
35 Calcium Hypochlorite, solid granular 500 LBS $ 3.1900 | $ 1,595.00 Univar
$ 984,237.62 Univar

1 Aluminum Sulfate/Alum (liquid), bulk 249,000 GAL $ 14100 | $ 352,110.90 USALCO
12-A Poly Aluminum Chloride (Water) 215,000 GAL $ 29636 | S 637,174.00 | USALCO
12-B Poly Aluminum Chloride (Waste Water) 102,000 GAL $ 34574 | S 352,654.80 USALCO
17 Ferrous Chloride, liquid, industrial grade, bulk, 25,000 GAL $ 14550 | S 36,375.00 USALCO

$ 1,378,314.70 | USALCO

5 Chlorine (liquefied gas)

8 Chlorine/Sodium Hypochlorite, liquid, 15%

28 Soda, caustic, 50%, liquid
$ 5,087,241.38
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